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Investment Objective 
 

The Fund aims at long-term capital growth and income by investing in debt securities of Asian bond markets 

denominated in EUR, USD, GBP, JPY, AUD, NZD or any Asian currency in accordance with the Sustainability Key 

Performance Indicator Strategy (Relative). In this context, the aim is to outperform the sub-fund’s Sustainability KPI 

compared to sub-fund’s benchmark to achieve the investment objective. 

 

What Happened in June 
 

In June, amid increasing political noises around the globe, Asian credit (JACI composite) managed to deliver a decent 

1.2% total return, primarily driven by rates rally and carry as spreads widened moderately across the board. Asian high 

yield (HY) (+1.3%) continued to perform slightly better versus investment grade (IG) (+1.2%), thanks to superior carry.  

  

In H1, Asian credit pocketed 2.8% in total return, driven by 50-basis point (50-bps) spread tightening with 2.5% spread 

return, while duration remained volatile with 0.3% return. Asian IG delivered 1.6% in total return, beating JP Morgan US 

Liquid Index’s (JULI’s) -0.1% total return, thanks to strong spread performance. Asian HY returned 10.5%, significantly 

outperforming other HY markets, as the market reprices towards lower default risk. 

 

For the month of June, US rate volatility and a busy new issue calendar placed pressure on Asian IG credit spreads (+7 

bps), with the IG market generally widening across the board. India surprised the market with a disappointing election 

result as Modi failed to secure a majority. However, Indian credits remained resilient, setting it apart from the knee-jerk 

reaction witnessed in the foreign exchange (FX) and rates market. Overall, we find the implications of the electoral 

results for Indian corporate and financial credits to be neutral against a supportive pre-existing policy environment and 

macroeconomic backdrop that is likely to be sustained in the new term. New issue market was very active in June, with 

new IG issuances coming from across a wide range of countries and sectors. New issue debut performances were also 

diverse, with outperforming new issues being those priced with decent premium, while the underperforming ones were 

priced too tight despite being in certain favourable sectors. 
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In the Asian HY market, most of the sectors were humming along. There were a few idiosyncratic stories in the Real 

Estate sector that stood out which saw strong rally due to positive refinancing developments, while the frontier countries 

consolidated. Indonesian HY also had a strong month, thanks to positive rating stories, while Indian Renewables 

continued to see strong demand despite tight spread levels. China HY delivered another strong month on the headline 

level, driven by Utilities and Real Estate, although the Real Estate sector continues to see increasing divergence of 

performance among the names. On the policy front, China’s policy makers during the month jointly called for a better 

implementation of property whitelist mechanism, while Beijing lowered the minimum down payment ratio for first 

homes and lowered mortgage rates, marking it the last tier 1 city to announce relaxation measures. 

 

Frontier market has underperformed this month despite overall positive developments. For Pakistan, the ambitious fiscal 

targets announced mid-month are believed to be able to pave the way for a new International Monetary Fund (IMF) 

programme. In Sri Lanka, local media has reported that the country is engaging bondholders for a second round of talks 

regarding the restructuring of its defaulted USD-denominated bonds, implying further move forward towards the 

restructuring finish line. 

 
Portfolio Review 
 

The Fund returned positively (gross, USD) for the month. 

 

Our tactical adjustments in duration positions during the month contributed positively to relative performance. In terms 

of country allocation, our overweight in Hong Kong and India contributed positively, while our underweight in Singapore 

slightly dragged. Sector-wise, our overweight to Financials and underweight in Quasi-sovereigns have contributed 

positively. Specifically for the Fund, we maintain our overweight HY versus IG allocation, which gives us the carry in the 

portfolio. We are more tactical on duration positioning and looking to add duration at the right level.    

 

Market Outlook 
 

For H2, as political noises set to increase around the globe, we expect overall credit beta to have higher volatility than in 

H1, particularly given much tighter spread levels across global credit markets. Nonetheless, we continue to expect Asia 

credit to deliver resilient and stable returns, thanks to the region’s overall political stability, decent macro and corporate 

fundamentals, robust technicals, as well as attractive carry. As a result, we remain a long carry factor across our credit 

strategies while slightly reducing our overall spread risk.  

 

Asia HY has outperformed other credit markets year-to-date by a large margin and remains reasonably attractive 

considering its higher rating composition. The favourable credit cycle of most of the sectors in Asian HY space gives us 

comfort to build our core holdings with stable carry, while normalisation of default rate in China offers spread 

compression and credit repricing opportunities. That said, as certain sectors and corporates are navigating the 

downcycle, credit selection in those sectors is key to outperformance. 
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All data are sourced from Bloomberg and Allianz Global Investors, as at 30 June 2024 unless otherwise stated. 
 
The information presented here is intended for general circulation and does not constitute a recommendation to anyone; 
it also has not taken into account the specific investment objectives, financial situation or particular needs of any 
particular person. Information herein is based on sources we believe to be accurate and reliable as at the date it was 
made. We reserve the right to revise any information herein at any time without notice. No offer or solicitation to buy or 
sell securities and no investment advice or recommendation is made herein. In making investment decisions, investors 
should not rely solely on this publication but should seek independent professional advice. However, if you choose not to 
seek professional advice, you should consider the suitability of the product for yourself. Past performance of the fund 
manager(s) and the fund is not indicative of future performance. Prices of units in the Fund and the income from them, if 
any, may fall as well as rise and cannot be guaranteed. Distribution payments of the Fund, where applicable, may at the 
sole discretion of the Manager, be made out of either income and/or net capital gains or capital of the Fund. As a result of 
the payment, the Fund’s net asset value is expected to be immediately reduced. The dividend yields and payouts are not 
guaranteed and might change depending on the market conditions or at the Manager’s discretion; past payout yields 
and payments do not represent future payout yields and payments. Investment involves risks including the possible loss of 
principal amount invested and risks associated with investment in emerging and less developed markets. The Fund may 
invest in financial derivative instruments and/or structured products and be subject to various risks (including 
counterparty, liquidity, credit and market risks etc.). Investing in fixed income instruments (if applicable) may expose 
investors to various risks, including but not limited to creditworthiness, interest rate, liquidity and restricted flexibility risks. 
Changes to the economic environment and market conditions may affect these risks, resulting in an adverse effect to the 
value of the investment. During periods of rising nominal interest rates, the values of fixed income instruments (including 
short positions with respect to fixed income instruments) are generally expected to decline. Conversely, during periods of 
declining interest rates, the values are generally expected to rise. Liquidity risk may possibly delay or prevent account 
withdrawals or redemptions. Past performance, or any prediction, projection or forecast, is not indicative of future 
performance. Investors should read the Prospectus obtainable from Allianz Global Investors Singapore Limited or any of 
its appointed distributors for further details including the risk factors, before investing. The duplication, publication, 
extraction, or transmission of the contents, irrespective of the form is not permitted, except for the case of explicit 
permission by Allianz Global Investors. This publication has not been reviewed by the Monetary Authority of Singapore 
(MAS). MAS authorization/recognition is not a recommendation or endorsement. The issuer of this publication is Allianz 
Global Investors Singapore Limited (79 Robinson Road, #09-03, Singapore 068897, Company Registration No. 
199907169Z).  
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